
 PAKISTAN AIRPORTS AUTHORITY 
ADVERTISEMENT TEXT FOR NEWS PAPERS, EPADS PAA AND PPRA WEBSITES  

 
TENDER NOTICE IT NO: HQPAA/1272/506/TLEL/XIV 

 
1. Tenders are invited for two (02) years Service Level Agreement / Maintenance Contract, for Qty. 
44 UPS(s) rating from 10KVA to 300KVA without parts and batteries installed / working at PAA 
Airports, The firm must be included In Active Tax Payer List of FBR and registered with Directorate of 
General sales tax and Services sales tax in accordance with PPRA Rule No.36-b, The firm must have 
at least 03 years experience in repair, maintenance and servicing of high ratings UPS(s) with proper 
workshop facility alongwith qualified manpower (Engineer/Technician) at Karachi, Lahore and 
Islamabad for Preventive and Corrective maintenance of UPS(s).   
 
2. A pre-bid meeting will be schedule on 25th & 26th February, 2025 between 10:00 to 1300 in the 
office of Additional Director CNS IIAP Islamabad Airport (Contact No: 051-95550333 & 051-95550007 
e-mail AdlDCNS.IIAP@caapakistan.com.pk) to provide prospective bidders with the opportunity to ask 
questions and receive clarifications regarding the scope of work, technical specifications etc.  

 
3. Bids must be submitted on or before 11th March, 2025. (1100hrs) as per conditions set out in 
bidding documents available on PPRA E-PAD System http://eprocure.gov.pk (Free of Cost). Bid will be opened on same date at 1130 hrs. Bidders are require to get registered at E-PADS PPRA (Federal) 
to access the bidding documents and other relevant information including electronic bid submission. 
 
4. Bid must be submitted electronically through PPRA E-PADS web portal http://eprocure.gov.pk 
before closing date & time as well as in hard format in a (separate sealed envelopes for Technical and 
Financial Bids as per single stage two envelop method) duly filled and attached with requisite 
information in specified format provided in the Bidding document to the Office of Additional Director 
Telecom & Electronics  CNS Directorate Headquarters Pakistan Airports Authority, Terminal-1 Jinnah 
International Airport Karachi. 
 
5. For registration and training on E-PADS or in case of any technically difficulty in using E-PADS, 
prospective bidder may contact Mr. Rizwan Mehmood Director MIS PPRA Room No. 109, 1st Floor 
FBC Building Sector G-5/2 Islamabad and contact Number 051-111-137-237. 

 
[Note: All prospective Bidders shall immediately inform PAA before bid opening date/time and submit 
proof of Active Tax Payer List (100% compliance) & GST/NTN certificates of FBR at the address below] 
 
6. Fixed Bid security of an amount in the shape of Pay Order / Bank Draft / Bankers Cheque from the 
list of Banks acceptable to PAA, drawn in favour of Pakistan Airports Authority should be submitted in 
original with technical bid. Copy of same must be attached through E-PADS online submission as well 
before submission Date & Time.  
 
7. The advertisement is also available on PAA website www.caapakistan.com.pk and PPRA website 
www.ppra.org.pk. 
 
8. Warning: Any financial instrument submitted by bidder. If found fake or got dishonored at any stage 
would result in blacklisting and legal action as per law.  

 Address: 
Additional Director Telecom & Electronics 

CNS Engineering Directorate 
Headquarters, Pakistan Airports Authority, 

Terminal-1, JIAP, Karachi. 
                              Phone No. 021-99072257 / 99072234 Fax No. 021-99242131 



 
 
 
 


